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 Year 11 Year 12 Year 13 

Course Content Students develop their ability to 
understand and communicate 
personal information, ideas and 
opinions in different situations. 
Topics are of immediate relevance 
to their lives, such as friends and 
family, entertainment, travel and 
social arrangements. Music, film 
and other authentic texts are 
incorporated into the course.  

Students engage in sustained 
interactions and produce 
increasingly extended texts. 
Exploring different views, they 
develop and share personal 
perspectives and justify, support or 
challenge ideas and opinions in 
different situations. Topics are 
adapted to interests, but typically 
include the French-speaking world, 
technology, youth culture and 
offering advice on problems 
typically faced by youth. The study 
of French film, music and other 
authentic texts are incorporated 
into the course.  

Engaging with a variety of extended 
texts, students will respond clearly 
and critically. Expected to explore 
the views of others more widely, 
they will not only develop and share 
personal perspectives, but also 
justify, support or challenge others’ 
ideas and opinions. Moving beyond 
immediate experience, students are 
encouraged to debate on social, 
environmental and ethical issues. 
Current affairs are incorporated into 
the course, along with the study of 
French film, music and other 
authentic texts. 

Prerequisites Completion of the full Year 9 and 
Year 10 French courses. 

Acceptable attainment in Level 1 
French. 

Acceptable attainment in Level 2 
French. 

Assessment Internal (5 credits) 
91964 Interact Portfolio  
 
 
External (10 credits) 
91967 Listening (5)  
91966 Reading (5) 

Internal (14 credits) 
91120 Spoken Presentation (4) 
91119 Interaction Portfolio (5) 
91122 Writing Portfolio (5) 
 
External (10 credits) 
91118 Listening (5)  
91121 Reading (5)  

Internal (14 credits) 
91544 Spoken Presentation (3) 
91545 Interaction Portfolio (6)  
91547 Writing Portfolio (5)  
 
External (10 credits) 
91543 Listening (5)  
91546 Reading (5)  

Costs 
$30-40 for Education Perfect and 
other resources.  

$30-40 for Education Perfect and 
other resources. 

$30-40 for Education Perfect and 
other resources. 

 


